

Robertson County Finance Department
Bid #1398 Expendable Supplies BOE
October 25, 2018 / 10 AM
Anticipated Annual Purchases Summary of Expendable Supplies
Based on 12 months purchasing history provided by BOE. (See Bid document)

		Vendor:	Advanced Supply Company	American Paper & Twine	American Poly	AVM Enterprises	A-Z Office	A-Z Office Alternate	Buckeye Cleaning Center	Kelsan	Kelsan Alternate	Anticipated Annual Purchases
Item	Description	Case Pack										
1	38 x 58 Black 1.2 mil Low Density Liner	100 EA/CT	\$ 26.15	\$ 16.19	\$ 19.38	\$ 14.95	\$ 17.49	\$ 15.65	\$ 24.40	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.65	43.00
2	38 X 60 Natural 16 Mic High D Liner 60 Gal on Roll 8/25	200/cs	\$ 29.19	\$ 21.58	\$ 35.55	\$ 18.09	\$ 20.50	\$ 20.50	\$ 25.57	\$ 21.75	\$ 20.09	613.00
3	30 X 37 Natural 10 Mic High D Liner 20-30 Gal on Roll 20/25	500/cs	\$ 16.32	\$ 15.91	\$ 43.27	\$ 13.28	\$ 18.25	\$ 15.25	\$ 20.00	\$ 16.25	\$ 17.00	572.00
4	DEB Antibacterial Foam Hand Soap 1 Liter or equivalent	6/cs	\$ 36.63	\$ 32.95	No Bid	\$ 47.00	\$ 55.84	\$ 19.95	\$ 60.30	\$ 39.15	\$ 39.15	673.00
5	1988001 Envision Embossed Toilet Tissue 2 Ply	80 RL/CT	\$ 51.19	\$ 31.19	No Bid	\$ 42.95	\$ 30.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 33.41	\$ 44.95	\$ 35.00	100.00
6	9021 Jumbo Junior Roll Toilet Tissue 2 Ply 1000	12RL/CS 48CS/SK	\$ 21.30	\$ 20.43	No Bid	\$ 16.40	\$ 19.50	\$ 19.50	\$ 20.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 17.35	1,219.00
7	04142 Scott Hardwound Roll Towel Natural 1 Ply 800 1.5"	12 RL/CT	\$ 16.11	\$ 32.55	No Bid	\$ 65.85	\$ 35.56	\$ 35.56	\$ 41.76	\$ 45.00	\$ 45.00	178.00
8	6602T Preserve White 2 Ply Center Pull Towel	6RL/CS 50CS/SK	\$ 20.70	\$ 22.73	No Bid	\$ 16.60	\$ 17.95	\$ 17.95	\$ 19.76	\$ 20.15	\$ 20.15	2,590.00
9	23304 Envision Natural 1 Ply Multifold Towel 250 Count	16 PK/CT	\$ 14.26	\$ 14.57	No Bid	\$ 15.80	\$ 16.50	\$ 16.50	\$ 17.75	\$ 22.20	\$ 14.95	247.00
10	20204 Acclaim White 1 Ply Multifold Towel 250 Count	16 PK/CT	\$ 15.63	\$ 17.76	No Bid	\$ 17.80	\$ 18.95	\$ 18.95	\$ 17.28	\$ 25.95	\$ 18.15	63.00
11	38 x 58 Black 1.2 mil Low Density Liner	100 EA/CT	\$ 26.15	\$ 16.19	No Bid	\$ 14.95	\$ 17.49	\$ 15.65	\$ 24.40	\$ 20.00	\$ 16.50	0.00
12	38 x 58 Black 1.5 Mil Trash can liner	100 EA/CT	\$ 26.02	\$ 21.16	No Bid	\$ 18.73	\$ 29.95	\$ 18.90	\$ 29.56	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00	750.00
TOTAL: (Price x Anticipated Annual Purchases)			\$ 164,591.14	\$ 158,476.02	\$ -	\$ 149,032.58	\$ 168,660.42	\$ 134,423.83	\$ 182,721.08	\$ 163,465.45	\$ 153,959.32	

* #4 for A-Z is priced for a case of 8. \$6.98 each.

* #7 for A-Z is for a case of 6 for \$17.78. The bid price is doubled to represent case of 12 for \$35.56

* #4 for A-Z Alternate bid is for a 2 ltr / 2 per cs- will swap out dispensers - No Charge

* #7 for A-Z Alternate bid is for a case of 6 for \$17.78. The bid price is doubled to represent case of 12 for \$35.56

* #12 for A-Z Alternate bid is for the **1.3** Mil trash can liner.

* #5 for Buckeye is for a 96 RL / CT

* #7 for Buckeye is for a case of 6 for \$20.88. The bid price is doubled to represent case of 12 for \$41.76

* #6 for Kelsan Alternate bid is for a case of 8 for \$17.35