

BID TABULATION: # 1424
CLASSROOM FURNITURE (For Existing Schools Only)
August 12, 2019 / 10:00 AM
All prices are FOB Delivered and shall be effective through June 30, 2020

ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	A-Z	HCONE	School Specialty	VIRCO
1	STACKING CHAIRS:					
	(A) HARD PLASTIC, 5/8" thickness, H type frame, steel glides, chrome legs with brace.					
	13 - 13 1/2"	0-99	63.87	83.43	50.86	61.88
		100-299	63.87	81.89	50.86	61.88
		300-499	63.87	80.34	50.86	61.88
		500-UP	63.87	78.80	50.86	61.88
	15 - 15 1/2"	0-99	64.82	84.65	54.06	66.35
		100-299	64.82	83.08	54.06	66.35
		300-499	64.82	81.51	54.06	66.35
		500-UP	64.82	79.94	54.06	66.35
	17 - 17 1/2"	0-99	66.71	86.27	57.37	68.01
		100-299	66.71	84.67	57.37	68.01
		300-499	66.71	83.07	57.37	68.01
		500-UP	66.71	81.47	57.37	68.01
	(B) SOFT PLASTIC, with chrome or painted frames					
	13 - 13 1/2"	0-99	61.32	42.12	28.89	29.27
		100-299	61.32	41.34	28.89	29.27
		300-499	61.32	40.56	28.89	29.27
		500-UP	61.32	39.78	28.89	29.27
	15 - 15 1/2"	0-99	62.26	45.77	31.66	33.17
		100-299	62.26	44.92	31.66	33.17
		300-499	62.26	44.07	31.66	33.17
		500-UP	62.26	43.22	31.66	33.17
	17 - 17 1/2"	0-99	62.26	45.77	34.04	34.56
		100-299	62.26	44.92	34.04	34.56
		300-499	62.26	44.07	34.04	34.56
		500-UP	62.26	43.22	34.04	34.56
2	FOLDING CHAIRS: approximate open dimensions - 18" x 21" x 30", 4 hinge construction, metal, painted finish					
		0-99	25.37	22.68	21.14	30.11
		100-299	25.37	22.23		30.11
		300-499	25.37	22.23		30.11
		500-UP	25.37	21.97		30.11
3	OPEN FRONT DESK: metal book box, adjustable legs, high density laminated top & painted legs					
		0-99	124.90	89.70	80.18	79.48
		100-299	124.90	89.70		79.48
		300-499	124.90	88.67		79.48
		500-UP	124.90	88.67		79.48

BID TABULATION: # 1424
CLASSROOM FURNITURE (For Existing Schools Only)
August 12, 2019 / 10:00 AM
All prices are FOB Delivered and shall be effective through June 30, 2020

ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	A-Z	HCONE	School Specialty	VIRCO
4	(A) ARM CHAIR DESK: 17 - 17 1/2" hard plastic seat, arms & back, steel glides, braced legs (Artco Bell H257 or similar)					
	(1) With book rack	0-99	136.79	151.07	NO BID	154.99
		100-299	136.79	148.27	NO BID	154.99
		300-499	136.79	145.47	NO BID	154.99
	(2) Without book rack	0-99	125.97	139.73	NO BID	162.03
		100-299	125.97	137.14	NO BID	162.03
		300-499	125.97	134.55	NO BID	162.03
	(B) LEFT HAND ARM CHAIR DESK: 17 - 17 1/2" hard plastic seat, arms & back, steel glides, braced legs (Artco Bell H257 or similar)					
	(1) With book rack	0-99	136.79	157.07	NO BID	160.00
		100-299	136.79	148.27	NO BID	160.00
		300-499	136.79	145.47	NO BID	160.00
	(2) Without book rack	0-99	125.97	139.73	NO BID	167.00
		100-299	125.97	137.14	NO BID	167.00
		300-499	125.97	134.55	NO BID	167.00
5	TEACHER'S DESK: 60" x 30" x 29 1/2". 6" overhang at end and back, central locking drawer, 24" pedestals (Artco Bell Model D500 or similar, double pedestal w/ center drawer)					
		0-25	550.00	498.48	NO BID	804.51
		26-50	550.00	473.55	NO BID	804.51
6	TEACHER'S CHAIR - HON 7901 or similar w/ five star base					
		0-25	142.56	126.13	NO BID	270.17
		26-50	142.56	123.26	NO BID	270.17
7	TABLES WITH LEGS: STANDARD HORSESHOE TABLES 60" x 66"					
		0-25	318.15	312.34	NO BID	265.93
		26-50	318.15	312.34	NO BID	265.93
8	TRAPEZOID TABLES: 30" x 30" x 30" x 60", painted adjustable legs with mounting brackets, 1 1/4" solid core top with high pressure laminate finish					
		0-25	194.69	180.63	NO BID	136.59
		26-50	194.69	180.63	NO BID	136.59
9	COMPUTER TABLES: 72" x 30" High pressure top; adj height legs, tip flipper access to full length cable tray with surge suppressor, fully assembled					
		0-25	NO BID	295.25	NO BID	418.30
		26-50	NO BID	295.25	NO BID	418.30
10	COMPUTER TABLES: 72" x 25" High pressure top; adj height legs, tip flipper access to full length cable tray with surge suppressor, fully assembled					
		0-25	NO BID	236.93	NO BID	385.68
		26-50	NO BID	236.93	NO BID	385.68

BID TABULATION: # 1424
CLASSROOM FURNITURE (For Existing Schools Only)
August 12, 2019 / 10:00 AM
All prices are FOB Delivered and shall be effective through June 30, 2020

ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	A-Z	HCONE	School Specialty	VIRCO
11	COMPUTER TABLES: 60" x 30" High pressure top; adj height legs, tip flipper access to full length cable tray with surge suppressor, fully assembled	0-25	NO BID	264.06	NO BID	379.55
		26-50	NO BID	264.06	NO BID	379.55
12	COMPUTER TABLES WITH LEGS: DURABLE PLAIN TABLES 30" x 60" x 22" x 29"H w/perma tuff edging - fixed height	0-25	212.50	591.80	NO BID	231.35
		26-50	212.50	591.80	NO BID	231.35
13	COMPUTER TABLES WITH LEGS: DURABLE PLAIN TABLES 30" x 72" x 22" x 29"H w/perma tuff edging - fixed height	0-25	218.49	672.65	NO BID	277.25
		26-50	218.49	672.65	NO BID	277.25
14	COMPUTER TABLES WITH LEGS: DURABLE PLAIN TABLES 24" x75" x 22" x 29"H w/perma tuff edging - fixed height	0-25	255.19	614.90	NO BID	277.25
		26-50	255.19	614.90	NO BID	277.25
15	COMPUTER CHAIRS: swivel chair, soft plastic shell, adjustable seat height, w/ 5 leg base and contoured back (Artco DP9A or approved equal)	0-25	113.39	111.30	96.82	142.32
		26-50	113.39	111.30	96.82	142.32
16	COMPUTER CHAIRS: student chair, soft plastic shell, contoured back	0-25	57.89	68.60	34.04	NO BID
		26-50	57.89	68.60	34.04	NO BID
17	HON 4 drawer LEGAL file cabinets, 25" depth w/ lock and file hangers, fully assembled	Black	274.26	252.88	NO BID	NO BID
		Putty	274.26	252.88	NO BID	NO BID
18	HON 4 drawer LETTER file cabinets, 25" depth w/ lock and file hangers, fully assembled	Black	228.06	216.33	NO BID	NO BID
		Putty	228.06	216.33	NO BID	NO BID
19	HON 2 door storage cabinets, 36"W x 18"D x72"H, w/lock, fully assembled	Black	397.74	390.45	NO BID	NO BID
		Putty	397.74	390.45	NO BID	NO BID

* See Bid document for required purchase quantities.